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After relocating to Moraga from Salt Lake City, Utah 
in 2010, Sarada attended Campolindo High School, 
participating in basketball, volleyball, Future 
Business Leaders of America, Model UN, LaPuma, 
and Academic Decathlon; where she was awarded 
nine out of ten medals at County in 2013, and 
seven out of 10 medals at County in 2014, as well 
as a gold and silver medal at state, and four gold, 
two silver and one bronze medal at Nationals, 
missing only one medal in one category. She 
worked part time as a Lifeguard at Moraga Ranch 
Swim Club for the past three swim seasons. She 
played club volleyball all four years for Diablo 
Valley and Pacific Rim serving as team captain. She 
was a school reporter for two years and, senior 
year Editor-In-Chief of LaPuma, Campolindo's 
school paper, wrote articles for Lamorinda Weekly 
and was an AP Scholar. She will be heading to 
Northeastern University in Boston where she will be 
enrolled in their Honors Program and the College of 
Engineering. In celebration she is headed to a well 
deserved vacation in Paris and Italy this summer.  

 

 
 
 
 
 
Reach the reporter at: info@lamorindaweekly.com
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