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Moraga  | $2,355,000
This elegant four bedroom, four and one-half bath estate property boasts an open floor plan, oak hardwood floors, wainscoting details and custom millwork.

Elena Hood 925.254.3030
elena@orinda.com | CalRE #01221247

Moraga  | $1,495,000
Set on more than 1.25 acres close to shops, this four bedroom, two and one-half bath, two-story home on a cul-de-sac is light and bright with many updates.

Michelle Holcenberg 925.253.4663
michelle@holcenberg.com | CalRE #01373412

Orinda  | $1,525,000
Gated, 2-level, 4bd/3ba Orinda home w/meticulous features & large backyard.

Lynn Molloy 925.253.6324
lynn.molloy@cbnorcal.com | CalRE # 01910108 

Orinda  | $1,495,000
Classic contemporary 4bd/2ba home w/upgrades, great views & privacy.

Shellie Kirby 925.253.6321
shellie@shelliekirby.com | CalRE #01251227 

Wilder Development Agreement Amendment approved by council, but not by residents
By Sora O’Doherty

Some Wilder residents were 
frustrated by a change to the 

Wilder Development Agreement 
that will, if fi nalized on March 20, 
authorize the developer to elimi-
nate planned walkways to offset 
losses caused by the installation of 
noncompliant sidewalks in other 
parts of the development.  
 Originally, pathways beside the 
streets in Wilder were to be con-
structed of decomposed granite, but 
that was later changed to asphalt.  
The builders, however, thought that 

asphalt was not a good choice for 
long-term maintenance and instead 
installed cement sidewalks on many 
streets, which was verbally ap-
proved by the city planning depart-
ment.  While the 3-foot sidewalks 
comply with the federal Americans 
with Disabilities Act, they fail to 
meet the accessibility requirements 
of the California Building Code, so 
they must be removed and replaced 
with 4-foot wide sidewalks at the 
expense of the property owner, OG 
Property Owner, LLC. 

 Reached after the meeting, 
Bruce Yamamoto, Wilder project 
manager for OGLLC, estimated 
the costs involved to remove the 
constructed 3-foot sidewalks and 
replace them with 4-foot sidewalks 
at between $160,000 to $200,000.  
If you include necessary landscap-
ing replacement, and construction 
of the 6-foot section on Wilder 
Road, overall costs rise to around 
$700,000. To construct sidewalks 
on the streets proposed for sidewalk 
elimination would cost nearly an 
additional $400,000 to $500,000, 
Yamamoto estimated.
 Since having no sidewalks 
does not violate either the CDC 
or the ADA and is consistent with 
Orinda’s “semi-rural” character, 
eliminating further sidewalks was 
proposed, with the exception of a 
6-foot wide sidewalk on Wilder 
Road, the subdivision’s public col-
lector street. Opinions from vari-
ous groups were gathered prior to 
proposing the pathway or sidewalk 
elimination.  According to Plan-
ning Director Drummond Buckley, 
the modifi ed circulation plan has 
the support of the Wilder Home-
owner’s Association, the Moraga-
Orinda Fire District, the Orinda Po-

lice Department and the East Bay 
Regional Park District. Developer 
Scott Goldy agreed that everybody 
is concerned with safety, but stated 
that they sought a lot of advice that 
supported the proposed changes. 
The Planning Commission, howev-
er, split 2-2 on the sidewalk issue.
 A number of current Wilder 
residents attended the Feb. 20 city 
council meeting to ask that the 
elimination of sidewalks not be ap-
proved, citing extra property taxes 
that residents pay, a hefty special 
assessment for amenities that other 
Orinda residents do not pay, safety 
concerns, and prior commitments 
made by the developer. Christophe 
and Sophie Davis, aged 9 and 7, 
appealed to the council to support 
sidewalks and their father Vincent 
felt compelled to speak up as well.  
Mark Bresnik said that he is a doc-
tor of infectious diseases, and sees 
sidewalks as necessary measures 
to prevent accidents.  He drew an 
analogy to seat belt laws: the risk 
of accidents may be low, but the 
degree of harm would be high.  
Bresnik and Madelyn Mallory also 
submitted extensive written com-
ments in favor of sidewalks, as did 
other Wilder residents.

 Explaining the rationale behind 
the sidewalk elimination proposal, 
Yamamoto said Wilder was always 
planned to be a semirural communi-
ty under a dark sky ordinance, with 
no streetlights on the private roads, 
only at major intersections.  Most of 
the streets for which sidewalk elimi-
nation is proposed are dead end cul-
de-sacs, while most of the streets that 
lead down to Wilder Road are in the 
section that will have sidewalks. 
Further, he emphasized that few of 
the lots on the sidewalk-elimination 
streets have been sold, and that the 
vendors are engaging in full disclo-
sure to potential buyers. Davidon 
only recently started selling homes, 
and have obtained signed disclo-
sures from all their buyers.  Taylor 
Morrison has thus far only sold on 
Wilder Road, which will have a 
sidewalk on one side.  
 Mayor Amy Worth voted 
against the DA amendment.  Vice 
Mayor Inga Miller voted in favor, 
but strongly favored sidewalks.  She 
noted that sidewalks were never 
planned for Wilder and that side-
walks are not consistent with Orin-
da’s semi-rural environment, but 
added that “semi-rural is a thing of 
the past.   ... continued on page A10
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We off er both a relaxed atmosphere and 

a sports bar, something for families, 

couples, students and seniors. On the 

menu you’ll see many of Roman Italian 

specialities, from the classic bruschetta 

made with melted fontina cheese and 

sautéed mushrooms to mista and 

arugula salads, an array of wood-fi red 

pizzas and paninis, and no shortage of 

primis and seconds. The restaurant has 

full bar and a generouse wine list.Find Us On

www.tavernapellegrini.com   •   www.pizzapellegrini.com


