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HOMEWORK HELP FOR ALL LEVELS

Flat Monthly Fee
Drop-in any time, no scheduling needed!
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Must present coupon. New students only.

GET AHEAD IN MATH THIS FALLGET AHEAD IN MATH THIS FALL

WHEN MATH MAKES SENSE, YOU SUCCEED!

3435 Mt. Diablo Boulevard, Lafayette
(Golden Gate Way at Mt. Diablo Blvd.)

(925) 283-4200   www.mathnasium.com

Theater View Veterinary Clinic
• Offering your pets compassionate care

• Modern hospital and equipment

• Long tenured, experienced staff

• Puppy classes for our clients

Dr. Laurie Langford-owner 

1 Bates Blvd., Suite 200
Orinda, CA 94563

P: (925) 317-3187
F: (925) 334-7017

E: theatervieworinda@gmail.com
W: www.theaterviewvetclinic.com Dr. Amelia Ausman 

Orinda baby food store helps organization 
collect diapers for mothers in need
By Vera Kochan

According to Help A Mother 
Out, a nonprofi t organization 

that distributes donated diapers to 
institutions and families in need, 
one in three families struggle to 
afford diapers, which can cost $75-
$100 a month. Public assistance 
programs (such as food stamps) 
don’t help with this basic need and 
the lack of a clean diaper can affect 
a baby’s health, because they may 
have to spend extended time in a 
dirty diaper.  Most childcare pro-
grams require parents to provide 
clean diapers. Without clean dia-
pers, babies must stay at home with 
adult supervision, thereby keeping 

the adult unemployed, reducing the 
family’s chances of being fi nan-
cially self-suffi cient. Square Baby 
in Orinda’s Theatre Square is team-
ing up with HAMO to help. 
 Donated diapers can be placed 
in the large bin outside of Square 
Baby on a continuing basis. Katie 
Thomson, co-owner along with 
Kendall Glynn, says, “We will ac-
cept diapers, pull-ups and baby 
wipes (in original packaging), new 
cloth pocket diapers, even partial 
boxes (unopened sleeves) of dia-
pers and wipes such as those pur-
chased in big box stores.” Sizes 4-6 
are especially needed, but all sizes 

are accepted and appreciated.
 Square Baby, which sells baby 
food aimed at providing “a square 
meal,” has also been involved 
with donating its products to Fam-
ily House, a sister organization of 
UCSF Benioff Children’s Hospital 
that provides extended stay to fam-
ilies of children being treated for 
cancer and other life-threatening 
illnesses. Thomson and her hus-
band, Kevin, Square Baby’s mar-
keting director, have taken their 
two children with them to volun-
teer at Family House. “We want 
them to appreciate how lucky they 
are,” Thomson explained.
 Patients at Family House can 
enjoy a variety of healthy baby food 
such as Mango Coconut Chicken, 
Salmon Mash, Apple Rosemary 
Lentils and Peachy Oatmeal, just to 
name a few.
 Square Baby also sponsors a 
periodic Mom’s Night Out at the 
store where they give away baby 
meals, swag bags and gift certifi -
cates for Baby Boot Camp, a work-
out class for moms who just had a 
baby.
 With personally developed 
recipes and all natural ingredients, 
Square Baby has begun to ship 
product throughout California, 
Washington, Oregon, Idaho, Ari-
zona and most recently Colorado. 
Thomson states, “We expect to ship 
to the East Coast next year.”
 For more information about 
Square Baby, visit www.squareba-
by.com or call (415) 273-9756. The 
Orinda store, located at 2 Theatre 
Square, suite 112, is open Monday 
through Saturday from 11a.m. to 3 
p.m. 
 For information about Help 
A Mother Out, visit www.hel-
pamotherout.org.

Diaper donation bin outside of Square Baby Photo Vera Kochan

The prolific practice of  yoga is expanding
By Lou Fancher

As a former professional ballet 
dancer and physical fi tness 

devotee, I’m always seeking ath-
letic challenges and opportunities. 
Running, biking, hiking, swim-
ming, tennis, weightlifting and 
occasional tree climbing began re-
cently to take their toll, so I turned 
my attention to yoga, an endeavor 
I thought might be in my future. 
Reaching out to people in the Lam-
orinda community, I discovered a 

world wonderfully open to multiple 
generations, inclusive of all gender, 
race, ethnic and faith identities and, 
signifi cantly, available to people 
living on generous or limited bud-
gets.
 While not endorsing a specifi c 
outlet, a simple Google search re-
vealed yoga available in the East 
Bay at community centers, local 
gyms, pilate and dance studios, and 
specialty spas and boutiques. Pri-
vate lessons conducted in-home by 
expert practitioners represent top-
price options, while free programs 
found online, at public libraries 
(Yoga Storytime for ages 2-5 at La-
fayette Library, just one example) 
or outdoor, in family-friendly ses-
sions held in local parks (Berkeley 
has one monthly) extend the oppor-
tunities. Opening the window to the 
many techniques available, yoga 
can be practiced in 100-degree 
temperatures (Bikram), with baby 
goats (Yogoat), suspended in the 
air (aerial) or privately in homes, to 
name only extremes.
 Important especially for nov-
ices, yoga honors long-held tradi-
tions and in 2018 is practiced and 
best learned from forward-thinking 
certifi ed professionals like Bela 
Watson, a master’s candidate at 
Saint Mary’s College in Moraga. 
Watson is a graduate of North 
Carolina School of Yoga (now the 
Shanti Niketan Ashram) and has a 
a degree in fi ne arts from Florida 
State University. Diagnosed with 
cancer that temporarily interrupted 
her performing and instructional 
dance career, she turned to yoga for 
physical rehabilitation. The mind-
body connection applied to move-
ment therapy is her focus.
 In the United States, Watson 
says popular yoga trends are spe-
cifi c to each city or town. Address-
ing the Hatha, Yin, Children’s, Vin-
yasa, Flow and Power Flow styles 
she is qualifi ed to lead, Watson says 
people in high income locations 
prefer approaches that emphasize 
physical exertion and aesthetics. 
“(In contrast), folks attending in 
less fi nancially abundant commu-
nities appreciate the spiritual as-

pects more. Perhaps it is because 
people in lower income areas typi-
cally hold jobs where physical la-
bor is exhausting and thus come to 
yoga to quiet the body and mind,” 
she says.
 A new trend pairs cacao cer-
emonies or plant-based medicines 
with yoga; aiming to achieve 
greater healing or calming through 
organic substances combined with 
focused poses, breath work, medi-
tation and other ceremonial as-
pects of yoga. Western medicine’s 
goal-oriented, “fi x it” approach to 
health, Watson says, means slower 
recognition comes to yoga’s trans-
formational practices in America 
than does in India and other Eastern 
countries and cultures.
 Watson’s comments notwith-
standing, there is good indication 
that yoga is more mainstream than 
ever before. At Aegis of Moraga, 
Life Enrichment Director Tina 
Laurena says up to 30 residents 
participate. Offered twice weekly 
to Assisted Living and Memory 
Care residents, instructors Esther 
Jun and Anandi Martinez adapt 
poses to accommodate 90-year-old 
bodies and more. “When the resi-
dents see chair yoga on their sched-
ule they will ask about it the whole 
day,” says Laurena. “They get ex-
cited. When I ask them ‘How was 
yoga?’ they reply with a smile and 
say ‘wonderful.’ To see them do the 
poses and focus on their breathing 
is amazing.” Several residents, she 
adds, report improved moods after 
the lessons.
 Charlie Craig, 17, is a Cam-
polindo High School student and 
a linebacker and tight end on the 
football team. He took yoga taught 
by phys ed instructor Chris Walsh, 
who completed a YogaWorks 500 
Hour Teacher Training Certifi ca-
tion program in 2017. “It was a 
health P.E. requirement needed to 
graduate, but I took yoga because 
I wanted something relaxing that 
seemed interesting.” Craig’s favor-
ite pose was savasana, also known 
as corpse pose.
 ... continued on Page B3
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Fine Jewelry since 1977

Expanding our Services with
Two Goldsmiths

• Custom Designs
• Expert Repairs

• Appraisals 
• Pearl Restringing

All your jewelry is insured with Jeweler’s Block Insurance.

$5 off  Watch Battery
Reg $15, Now $10

1 watch battery per person. Exp. 12/31/18. Usually installed while you wait.  W/coupon. Restrictions apply.

3645 Mt. Diablo Blvd., Lafayette between Trader Joes & the Post Offi  ce

283-2988    www.waredesigns.com   Tuesday-Saturday 10-6

THE OSLC CONCERT SERIES PRESENTS 
 

T�� H��� F��	�� 
An
 T���
 N�-S�-H��� R�la���e�! 

 
4:00 �� 

Sunday, December 16, 2018 
Our Savior’s Lutheran Church 

1035 Carol Lane, Lafayette 
 

Free admission/Freewill offering 




