
84 Tarry Lane
Can’t beat desirable Sleepy Hollow 
location! Updated 4 bd/ 3 ba home 
on .75 acre setting w/ woodland 
views!

46 La Campana Road
Marvelous Mid-Century Modern 3 
bd/ 2 ba 2,738 sqft home in the 
OCC w/ amazing views & bonus 
level below! 

778 Las Trampas
Charming 3 bd/ 2 bath w/ gourmet 
kitchen, updated bathrooms, & 
family room that opens to private 
quiet yard. 

$1,995,000$2,395,000

$1,495,000

23 Kittiwake Road
Private residential .43 acre lot in 
one of Bay Area’s most sought 
after neighborhoods. Close to 
Highway 24 & downtown!

$1,900/mo

$1,328,000
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67 Brookwood Road Unit #5
Rarely available 1 bed/ 1 bath 
condo. Prime location in the heart 
of Orinda w/ easy walking distance 
to downtown & BART!

$499,000

$2,095,000

535 Walnut Ave
Storybook Charm & terrific 
location! Single level 2 bed / 1 bath 
home on beautiful .22 acre lot w/  
bonus room! 

473 Beacon Ridge Lane
Amazing small gated community 
townhome w/ 3 beds/ 2.5 bath w/ 
beautiful views of hills, walking 
trails, & easy freeway access! 

$889,000 $619,000

241 Western Hills Drive 
Lovely 2 story 3 bed/ 2.5 bath duet 
on .23 acres in the heart of Pleasant 
Hill! Light & bright w/ many 
upgrades! 

$2,695,000

12 Ridge Lane
Single level 4 bd/ 3 bath home sits 
on .68 acre lot w/ a wall of French 
doors highlighting the spectacular 
views! 

460 Miner Road
Find one-level living at its best in 
this custom 4 bed/ 3 bath home 
approx. 3016 sqft on .93 acre lot w/ 
fenced pool, play area, & more!

$1,795,000
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49 Amigo Lane
New construction 5 bed/ 3.5 bath 
home in desirable Walnut Heights 
neighborhood w/ open floor plan 
& beautiful finishes!

7 Oak Arbor 
Mediterranean 5 bed/ 6.5 bath 
Estate in the Heart of the Orinda 
Country Club w/ views of majestic 
oaks and surrounding hills!

It’s Village. Of Course.

$4,500,000
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